T A 7 Sififs (Tr)




TS A= e FAR TF
SN AR
LB
‘qz’F Afewiet Ao A=




UNIVERSAL DECLARATION OF HUMAN RIGHTS.

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO LIFE, LIBERTY
AND SECURITY OF PERSON. ---- Arricle 3

NO ONE SHALL BE SUBJECTED TO TORTURE OR TO
CRUEL, INHUMAN OR DEGRADING TREATMENT OR PUN-
ISHMENT. -—--Article 5

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO RECOGNITION EVERY-
WHERE AS A PERSON BEFORE THE LAW.

—=-Article-6

NO ONE SHALL BE SUBJECTED TO ARBITRARY ARREST,
DETENTION OR EXILE. --—--—Arficle-9

EVERYONE CHARGED WITH A PENAL OFFENCE HAS THE
KIGHT TO BE PRESUMED INNOCENT UNTIL PROVED
GUILTY ACCORDING TO LAW IN A PUBLIC TRIAL AT
WHICH HE HAS HAD ALL THE GUARANTEES NECESSARY
FOR HIS DEFENCE.

—=-Article 11 (1)

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT
TO FREEDOM OF OPINION AND EXPRESSION.
-=-—-Article 19

EVERYONE HAS THE RIGHT TO FREEDOM OF PEACEFUILI.
ASSEMBLY AND ASSOCIATION -
remmneArtiche < 20



3

o e S HORC E R B E A EEAE A TR [ACE )

e wome oF R sAffefez 3f (2 o AEee
FANCE co TAT FE-FIH TS T F9e AgLTe g
JErETe Rl T | stereiTEe HeEnE Beifde Fee Sie TR FRE
g S | AT FAATE ST R AeAe! i A1 | 7 TE e
FEdTe e GwslE wiTaw Somie se 99 @RI qEEEE v
F9(TA HereE qTiied @it @sl *fE Ze'e ahre 7 WEa e
ol S AT TS (A1 S AT e g e
YaRo b b ATAHAE 9] TANE 9ee S (Ereniae afeTE o
e TEA-y 08y WE TAT SEIE THA WL ya8e | 9F 799 FYMC
WEE TAEE AfRuE wgEEa AE e 79 oNfEe siEee
(Fundamental Rights) a7+ S 4F afare | a6 were =g 5@
fawre Br=ata 4% wewe (United Nations) 37218 Fi#sa g4+
Tr= | 4% TEA 40 AGA R IR (YR T/ TG SRR (FEE
a7 farere SfEE omie A5 T 12 Yt e s 3w AR
473 (A ST GT ST W wetd FE e g T A
TEeel o MA@ webR-en 39, g9 wdTe e 9 4
&4 =1 Ff BT 1910E | O 429 FRfiEA (@14 $91% 3 2 A
FaES e el A e AR e T e O T Al
) GIEE 4o ToEld A[Zd GoEE J9F! 714 AT | S0 42 AT AHERE
frrseTae! o9t 1T ICE e T AR WITE | T SEEhe it e
% S SR [ ot o e, @@ g9 aeRe diidEe @
g = =Y g Frdfiren =i Rere wie @mwa dfewl 359 #ifR. [
T BiEe g 1o Heahe TE ©F SR (1 3711 5% 39 1
3l AragTE A EE <@ T, g (e B oW/ SRS e F4R IR
@ f wfgaste w1y wrg O oA aeifEe B & afkee
Wk Tad 2= T SN Seirel Fare @ e 9 e e,
w14 ey A gt = SR TR 2rETE T | A WELE SANe



4

Fgioe 29 44 g Sz Raw 95e 7o 782 TiEw 97 FA e Tive
reE |

W'Y FA| A & Aefoifte FRasa I3 w21
Ao Alsife ofe

HEAg WS AN e Fiele ewEel Fe 9| aWe SiEeE
HTHIEAA SAEE 19 951 A (A #4) 717 | SHe AETT O @i
ASMAZ 793 | Yovo 57 o[ Se el A1fEn 118 Bral FHEHE a0
14 TETE FFRIEeRE B9 561 (eava Tz Bhifes, afe afest sl
GG AHEEE SIA 96 (A 409 | Toe i e 9o Awes
| TR G2 e o o vty da e Teme AreTel
J2'5 | g FReam @2 ofe Fve e ummes |

() T @I Hesioma v/ AN, AGTTes Toad] 91 F4Ee
] AR esae @il e/ s Aeefbe 2 R esfe
iz e, Fafifes ayfer wiEn Ay furte/ ke 512w 395 |

(F) frfirew/ weisra b1 @1y o9/ oferay wq1/afare o
Feofa AT S e | .

(4) ClewfFE ©lg Boieg T (@I w3 T ] 58], FAE
o S Z Wﬁmﬁﬁwm@maﬁsﬁﬁmw
AT 7 95|

(o) 96AIE] =% ©12 IE AT/ WH1T T, 1 A3
HAieafva/arefaers 1 F5e @i S 72 999 |

(a) =eifA = il 7t e 7ee St (o0 9har s
©WE FE Uy ACHD! 2T (TRT T2 F9E(43 cwae AR e
TEINE AT 3%F) |

(2) woff I TaETHEs) M @ el wesaT 3, o



S

(R Ffifee e s s s S @ire
AR F9F | 9T CFGE 541 iR TEa Hide e wsiter
s st fofeatr 2arm oia wesis 7fam | -y

(F) G g2ferq et Aewfbe qﬁsmﬁﬁmﬂaﬂwmm
(RS O] 5 Eel i A ooz Ffifees e o
SR B AFTH FEEE a2 F@ |

() @I (192 99 S ATE SenhiE oE F-A=E 5y
IE- (AR ATE 928 49 (AETTe ) Wee SR weuw Afey ufe
sifbat #ffafEfea arere e Amdta are Gfen stmge ofe-Ryfe
G A W >t Arsere! 8 1, wa Hees/ 2ae 1, wiT
- ST S 91 T effraty sam oe @ ofE[E o6 5k
HiEre | fog ieifes susias gumfEs sf e saame
wafEfee /e e 9t F 9E vEiE @RIne Fees 95 | 5
=S| #e5 9% FUie Ta wemre Aiei ©irg W @[l W S
B 9/ WT RN T[T Aeule wiEn Fes 95 feaw
[HifeTaty FAMH WiE Gt owRge Ffifees wigaere s Famt @
e 3 A g3 aw SR vy 7= | (e S 5
TEER (@ AR T w1 g Aol st o5 e
adifde Sigae!, Hiarfie = amEs SR JeR 71 =1 e
GITER AT 15 (4 W P A w1 274 |) g S R
STl Festons ST/ wawr Teifte wifi) i Jare e
A W, AE, SEEe w wEE i e s
ElE (1 6D WTH| HRIT qGIE WifE Tate How @ | s B
Tite 4ifee B g0 aifies woifma avae @ oz s e
=T |

(1) ST iR TBeiTE Free ey sieste afa o2 s s @R ERfETE
(B3] 9% G AT T Y T 7 raie Bonpw T sigame
o |



6

(R) Gt 4ot ferefirees/ e w1/ "al veefe ey =ifv 1 Gt
qoere efieam waiz G e/ AifEns om/ @E R 26 9 uW R
(I FFCE (2R T AESE A/ @ dfefEfe e s weR
WETH 26T |

(%) FEYTE HeAfbe Faran 49— ARAFFE € WE AGE
R S AR S Sy 2 SR g e wfEee
HesiHTa Hafie e (24 & @ SE Fime JAAEn! oem aE ) A
aTF v WE'E e «fd ofFE e e gy I Hna ge
weifal REitae edrare Feemers (2ae 3@ o | (e af o 7gee
M E'q F9E @A ==4E)

(5) (FIH (FF4 TG 20A (S G FH1 (FIEE W% Te2s)
A2E IS WS T/ HT 7L F4E |

(R) “WITE’ &1%A HET 2w 419 AT SNl 41 AGR 5= wifEe |
(AT (64 T SleTed F9 FES W 729 FE A3 | 97 13
wsifeR wfter Fawe e W <[ 9@ T e 1 T aEEE
wieqe| wee e WifEers s sa W et wnsr fe
Sesioea T ofdl Coltparo! AfRsiEel SR Wiy FeF |

(¢) sl of sfewl, e 92 crge MR sRerets
@l 7w FfE oE @@ oAt AR FE Ay gz SRR
Srfifes® aire A« o e Fe1 Wiy oz 3R (@ fifess
STETE A1 A5, S(EA/ Y S AR T TR A6 9
] ) T A

TR GE HEEA AlEE PR OF CFEIT WA @oiqE
g Wiy wIfg #fF9- | Sof wee, @ STeFE Ty, FaETE
ZieT THEE w41/ G e 9o AREfhe o ©F ofedm hed W%
fifeee =g JE (ol T a4 |



7

GifRg #ol o =%

(%) o4 (OFFENCE) 8 Tigae =if#% #ifg &9 &

(2) B3 (SUMMONS) ¢ \Iwee uite aifes smEes fre
e w3 75l A (@I G /2 Wik e ae W e wg)

(@) YA (WARRANT) ¢ SWETE & 3fE amEes
offe REts SR v i i

(8) ©f#AGI #@@W (SEARCH WARRANT) ¢ @al e
HEE TEDT 5ARE A AF REwita wwere it wfe
[T |

(@) s#[®4 (COGNIZABLE OFFENCE) ¢ @ =i#aiss ang
atw TR [{EEE @S A[ERE EERTE 9 e Sihe S
A | G sEd SelY FAEe foeqe e e, o9, TR Tei)

(%) SfEFTAS] 244 (BAILABLE OFFENCE) 8 <t7 Siof@i4e
SR wifwe & AR Fige o)

(4) @ifam #ff§ 791 (NON COGNIZABLE OFFENCE) &
AT SRS AT WS eEEE S 9g3 T4 oire | efiae
a5 i g o oFg wF SeTe eswe |

(v) G\ (BAIL) 2 Swere WS &2 as fiffs +Fem o
(lfGa Radine (ovee 9aW1 GIrERienE SvEdE @A e
ferare e 3R fom, @ smEre fvel ofide S8l aveee oifze
+3 i st | seme Tl e Somd 4@ o g 95 a2
A |



EYF ¢ Ffea wirofie caralq
' €9 q?
(491 - 8y (FlEwE wiEa)

s, 1 gem afe waveq swae wfve 3t 1 om @ Gis
st (gemem), e a1 feorre Ay @ e awes wey
Heufbe S |

3, W ! SRTTe o] 9fFH e @

o, W @I GAR AN v 4F )

8. I SEER T T4l W =

¢. SEFR T 1 e 4 a1 o8t w4

v, AT g AR o[ A [

4. SATE (YR AN waly R Sreq IfRaw AfFE wEEl
Higaq =HE |

b, SR AR AT o R/ 9F e SMEre deRe 99|
fraue) e s 31 SmMEes @ @ S ssE s

s 4 @& @0 G SeEy 3R IR TvEEe B 4 |
((FTEwE] SEa 419 - ses)

Yo. WERETS Tl 275 (FFamal SEae Sso 44))

55, @ TANREE G Faae T AgEe sy Fa e
e oAf¥53 coftelat 341 31 T4 B8 39 (TR TEEE @ 8)

53, S (T S (s =i st wemieE ang it 9

R @ imfae AfEm fom wwe sz sred) s i w0
A A aTm AGfErE @aw AR esrme Wdd 5 caiae
91 Wi fare | sAvy AT AT 18 95w fowee opqq wes)
bEIe Wb 9 AMGE Sl ¥z o e #ine Wi sefime s



9

951 feoae aifeems e ol asqe 2ifem of@m # e am
TRt weifEs €% wmaEme Habeas Cnrpw;mﬁmﬁ
YW Sfed AR |

@I (el FEF o o

s 1R @I e REm (cRewa uigee 8y, 8y 4ED)

2| 7% A Afe e Wiy seEy A @, f5
GifSeraEn 7E8 (FrewE] wiE 8 4[|)

© | ¥ wOIFE FYIS i weEry eebe o, s el
(FrEmial wigeq 414 88)

g & (I oI5 AR e AT Wl o) fui

[ w2 s afEm Roe wre SiEa @ GE AT
@it Rt 9@ Feadl siwe wive o 9f e 391 @igan Sitas
TEE W 9 O uhe SR AN afhe wedie w s v
1 T wfersm fofae 3t am e civee s
@ IS aem e

HYE (TS SR Sl ¢

S| SR (T TR A ASE AEET @Y $4E A
ARIGA (RIS oids «fE emms =@ s

3 | EIETeS (AR ARER F@TRRE YR T @SS g
st wifate =il (ocESEiE am @R Ffre sore TG
JTEERE 4 TERI)

o | I GWEER (HYRT SEEE FETZEE A S
sivTe wWiveE T3 SRl REnE wwm s @ el i
STl /4 SEMe QR e (@ ewE SiEE 49 eo)

81| FEa  ofewd @A TEEE 7900 SEDG SN TR
(FrErE] WiEE 2y 72 [

@ | (HER @F EEE o7 SWETel qMeed Qe diaeE mEl



10

AW 7 38 9% fSeqe evd @i weldm Agde i 4R
AR | (RYFE 22 4/ TE GFEmE] I eanT 4E)

b [ FE Al W TR (AR wiEwE |

4| Bbs @EE fve of seRi PR g 49 =1
e cors, HFowe AFm 93 Beer 3 aflk o= weF
fraEm fiwen ggm EA-Aftnfe g3 @ffR) (CEEhiftE @er =
e Diewrss TgaE A3 IR Age= (2

v (AR ] T @ EE bR qr/ing A3 3R
AR | (e =WETE eo A2 44)

5 | WelENE Fde 2iEa FEARE e G 93 iR
GR WY AT ITARME AR A FEQ A ( TS T a8
w2 4i4)

yo | G Seaee eR 2 Tifin oRkE S|

Y | ST FIER SPEYs (HYE e SNMEee iaTe
M WA FfR #ANE | A Z7E CNEE SIEe SIEw TWE #i1TE |

v3 | GWEEA (HYR] AR S e (HYR TE G AEEE
coiarE wiEsE |

ve | G (oinae FYs 8 e ofds gedt ferare ageis
HiEFE |

v8 | W G Wifie s < e s o wetiee
a5 BIfea e ulEsR (CFeEmRl SEad yva 4&1)

(se) TR fE 1 anfie fErme sEeEe 49 sgge Sy
A S FIAE (AR S |

() 1 TR FAWe BT Towed <@ @i seaEaeaE
rers A% awe Fes e SfdaE cifae s

@fed AT @aFid 79T #iT -

cafdy =Fy G%E 4 @F 9 ogg F TF aEE e
s afFeE AR JuE s cer w9 AR e weEE
(BaF|H qEEE T Hf |



11

(F) GRAE @TER BeEee @dE Zw-

(%) (=2[ N JEEm STRT o4gfer, Toew, g SEFE Ty
fia o eigfe e

(o) AW SRR e 2@ o@e TaE TeR oF, SeEe #4919
] 4% SIS W HEF A gfed A4 Tl T4 TR 4F 5 |

(RO o GRS, T -

(F) 7o fouTe e -

(%) SIMETEE AF WL GWETS (BT (AR AR T
famm

(1) Rt 371 91 @RISR 7 2L -

(%) ol 1T s Rt cofrgre Qs -

() AEANEE W 7T -

(5) T% WL a1 20 -

() wfza 2= -

() i oget ot owea oo w3 -

Hif=T AR SN o-

(3) (e 3 =) R (SR sy ey 50)

(2) &= =0 ifEs wedia o1 sag i v d mwe & s
v # g e o1 FTRE 5

(o) feml (@ wTeTe, I fEmm) aggm anfs #otfimy ey
sl wiraw 15 oE |

(8) T e, 4 fersr (v Mt it s w19 S

(&) Twey T, 2w B9 Ay o s s )

Re & - FTowrer et (29l 51 witae sle s AE



12

(EfEsTAnE  (@ihe Gified SEw SR Al | A8 el wiEn
FiET Gl s Tl R

e =i (A 9] #iis-

() wfamrats SRy o, EafE ATEEE GEETE e TE
wefaE ) A st wedind i sita

(3) Tt R #fRre ‘et 77 @i Sifiaee @eRis
2t w7 <R 6@ 2Aa (CFEmR] SiRaE 8oy 411

(o) a7 wel8ie T AT Tk FEe Sife 77 1fE e
faras e |

(8) TfSFCaIY SRy 20 S P e 3ifERe g (vo e
i 7 fooqe) 2@ ST waIf WUl SEH] Saraed 5 2IEa
TS W A I 1 2| (FEmE o ¢ vy 4[)

(@) Z1f G5 (TRl cobare (S oieafarl e cafdl &
qifEae (HeliR o (A Era e 2 e welE e Sl e e
Hifsw 7 ofieE |

() FEE A Sl e e ARG SfEe qame B
34 e el a9al aEde fe wweR Sfie 5eTE 1 vEEH
wifsw fra ofie2 ) :

(1) TPWe, TR TS 29 &9 (54 T (HAA IM 50
iy fooae aff (oif5a owa F=sjef 7, (T8 vo a7 fabe Gt (oDt
witad afea Ster (EEmE! SiRrE Sea 4[) |

(v) B (SIS (29E (21 vo i foeae (ol s 7l
T (R Rl IfE GifE R SR | (e SEE sue
14q1) |

() © T TEE (FA AMATE FAME LTE 6T A FH
g e (1% G SiW FR o 51991 7 9aeE e sEre @
% S T s @ e 3 @E ey wfiee S
(CREHIT Tz obs 414



13

(so) TR el Welaia coss ARFT 28 T o iR foeae
iTbeE oo w2 'CA SR (ol SfEee (EEwAl Sigae ses g4 |

(55) FEMS (ZRR A6 TAye a4 e = it [asaE
7 «ifdre #efm wmEre FEme JNES Sig e 1f9E oE |

i rare e sl sem e -

A% S REaTe i 19[S 7 SR 55 TR, (70 g
o SR @ FAE G| TWHF F ATEE GEHE SHEEDE
F45/E 49 A, Rowts e o FeE «eT aeee ke e
w2l =fEATiE @ 1@ e aiRre g | eds Taafe
(@R ST @ S [{EEE 9 AW SEE e " SebeE-
freften $f@re, oo -

S | IR TEA A W T TS - |

2 | HEE urE WAEN e AgiEe oF Beore et Tl
Frapsiiad B T9aE 79 F96T |

o | 191 7EL Y WiAFE 2ifEa srEe weldieg erge
fFeen /b SEmR S Sfors T4 9% anRE e s e
FRata SRy 39T | weld e 2ulE AleE 39 edifae BiReaAm F
fia |

7 | e/ =reie i srER SR A s (IR e g e

¢ | SAF A G SEbE 2H WTHE AEES 240, T O
freaTa aifess W SfdE Srants e sfews e 3R

v | 7 wEFE T weal G Eae eved wgene wE
rerm fBfeewq wire st w5 9 Tovew JJIEEe a5e Ffe sferms
wifds FfEg #{a |

b | AT e e was] it s et 5 GEe GRE ST
4t foive Fiefiles o, wiodim woif=q evee gifeq T4l Fvge
TrEiibia e Head @ Teiibiad ) e 4 bfdesias o w9
ANA WAl e |



14

E Faisret @iz (NSA) 2t o aiféraiayere
coieliq wiETe Wibe 2'ce S 719 11 IPTEPE

Y | AT eAfE TEEE o1 wite 391 Fiofie ofeffe wite
a4 Fifees s = Tna =5 |

1 | R SR Feres 531 e fowge Tbe =@ gfenns
#% (Grounds of Detention) Z=i #iifaa-|

© | Gferals TS CFAC 99 Al TFQ) AWE WHs A [SeaT
A b weal wibaA e fim edorsta wirav (Representation)
o3/ #sl, T vawa Frasa s |

8 | TiEag WS 3R Wl ne foeee wibe o= aifes M
AufATE o1om 41 @dw TR @ (Advisory Board) 3 ¥« 2ifEe
FAI0e! IATENERE | TAMB! ATE WHE I I TR 2TrF g 51
w2 SbF 9 I T TR FE, 6L weOEE e i@
TR ST A EE S Ifer Feg 12 32ts HEy e e

b | O SR TS 5T B4 SITe 22 #fTR w9
N TR S 2 o, SfSmst S S 39 SE SATHE
off FAWTF (2 F4T ANS | T AT 5ASiE Sfels AN-Eheded
o S B 1Y ofg R SaEte coiae 3 I |

4 | i GRS TG 14 (Hae a4 el 25 25a
=S @R @S & & 47

> | SIi6F S99 ATHHIIE Gl SR FE(HE THIS0 1@ 9 |

so | wferasmme sfewas Mz T, SfHe, afeedn el
AN LA T IE o[ | TS i amE 95 e gt
were 3 efem wae s IfF oot afdess



15

3 | wifoe a1 FEorE [ sz afa eslqe fofe o[ wibe sl
e S ARG Fntens wfEeq |

efSrataE wiEqe wivs 1E F$99)

s | e o= 91 ofdeeie e @eEe 39S WE a9
TPRTSNIE F4 R SR Fgorsd TgaiE 2Nl 42 wibe 4
Fim e sfteeits (e 539 |

3 | SIS A G S IR A9 (HER A A aEhE
*fsfHe e wiRets oad 595 )|

| 2g A wiEe g AUEd weE wiEg T2, e [
farem wfay F@E o wfEET |

& | 0] TEET Mo SEewE F5iE W] TE SiEEE S |

Yl SRANE P

S| HRETE 23 7R A SEE ferwed T M Sl
ARl o3 7% 4R S e Swew A & A wmEwE (Writ
of Habeas Corpus) %% a1




16

Aefes AfsfRfes iR 279 49 Roae
R =i =698 9 9 oS w9 wll
wiRAMe 9! |

CH-eg- AN FARAL 3t FAF) SfEst ¢ FEd AfEfEfee
I (iR e FEieE 9 e e ST SIERE AE FE
AT Tz weldrR e =) = | By e e ame 2
o T T A W SEA Soah 4 9570 T TG ST P
AT Mz wolfrE o SrEfe @nERlE R @ e ghe
CEG] B Al | 54F1EY (SR Fofl S P 9 e
T VeI, SEH R T Neqn Sxfye afem =msl

e SE SERR cFre aREne [Rem Pt e
ufEE SRFiEE S IEEE OED R A o R e
WfEEE SFB] 241 3l e 518t FiEl 5] Gi4TeTe F49 el A7
a7 TGS AT S ST vl SAEE Fagene | 1 G|
G -G - SEANEE BT CEHE FATS (F 4999 EifEs
[ErEiibE WA, @Wﬂﬁiﬂ“ﬂﬁilﬂ“ﬂiﬁﬂﬂwﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ_
el Fiwate t= 7m, o -

(5) (ST ORI FIHEH AL AT CLE G54 HER] bale e
wlwtE /[cspe e, “af s fre wfee @ oive 719ts o9 eM
a9, corn (e g4 Mifds wolfm ebae (i6d ToF" (AMEd 9
GIEWAE $8ME AT 4eB)

(2) SIFIBI WIS SLAR SSIAE (@Al (FF SEe 30, T
54 Bfeiae i [/ durea s 39 e dEE Arers
CSI59 E3IR F9F |

iEefR f @Ew ghre FRee RS- ey e
R e aew (Bt o) wds | @ e ewgdn o



17

ArelfdE, S A AR 29 Hrd S WeEE am 98 25
Sl Ferg e o | R Ere 9ha iE e s o
GTEiie waw FMeseerg s &) :

(Hei /Giieeeed M whe/ aibve 3 Pige AwEE —

@i AffEaiE 3 wEAnREE A @ e (o) FE
1 T Aeotdee aAve wfee) @R aibe F414 2@ 318 954 fooqe
abad| aiedie same ffa #1ts | SR e 39 3 EEE o
R R & @ e Five a8 969 Reae @ ggm e
vt ebTe 2% IR Aeges (3) o TR wbe
Afea T AR gam T veid a1 oagtl En e (e
R A | RS TRl Tes Al a7 e S Agueed o
A @1 (@A T @ i, B e, R @ SR
[ Ffre, O FRTer 9 $91 EITe SARIE §IE Fe |
fi SRFE o @ e e aed) Trr el oq A,
coUs TRl [Eue oo o e @Y A e

(0) W= e T @ SR TS veidfer es4e [l
@ O s 39 AW Ay F96 | O FEIE AUES 9 SIS
b o4 afet-r o gwEl wfe R wE g Fae e
(ZNle HIEE w5 |

THCH ST WiE e i [oe wsel Wi seay @I
HEEE 1 9 b w9 A 05w T4 wiEen fa aE ) e
AT cFaE I A WEA LA Sire wiew @Ea | (3) e
AqEfes fomm o A T S0 5o | oad ORI aej SHE
[ R TS T | (@ GREie o alfEm i Few et ceeie
417 4 =R I FRGE 9iTEq 119073 | 98 WeAFE B UG ™%
fifst BITE) (@) cetm oifeiEfe o't amuETe &3 5o |

(&) I (S o AifE ) s arafas T wibe &4 a8



18

Y5 fABTEl SiEiT uEE FiwE S o T awE T aEEE
BIA% | (ET (FAIFE FHEFER T2 @R 9 Tal AEdT ge w9 femme
A 4 PnaE Ew armere derfieed Sitew (habeas
corpus) wifee a9 (1) S 97 HirEw ShFETF qfes Afaueasia
R AW, S o9 (@ EEE Wb F20g ve 1 Eeme
(A colteie F4a A1, (TrE SREel AT FST | AT AR FYEETE
FfAAEY FIE Wi 9 TE FEANE FEEE GYR [=hE FEe
ordl L A (O6F TioE T FY ANl 29w FEm Az eey e
| (I T304 A SR, @m e a1 ofifes, o GeE
EITA HeaE T4 FMS | AT GI5EE APl W @I @ oW S
@ @ gaod e sifesrl fagm, st @t o TS TWeE

e [petetia et/ fadies

G- SETE @ AfEEE wEe €39 99 90 99 eed
TR | wEfelq T TEe Heibied S9 49T et |  ameely dferE
2TIZH | G IFEEd aiE sfew T2 o4 9% 9671 @ty FEEs ane
we] Wz Wi wiRg @R adfas ool ooitet 3R T eiferan
sfa @M 2 ofery 3fm e ofiwmTie Tage e o
HUTE | GHII00] HHEE AFM T4 TfE A T 5o GiEE |
eaiclle o E-ER nEESEIERIR C Ll e B s o IR CE R I ETi
fffen /e 99547 9ol AEfbe TR A o5 HERE
frfere wifsrarst wifds <[ «ffe) Fdifee sadm wrad) s /e
T A | R ool FA1E 91 Trrd 47 ¥4 789 w5l el
FIfaTA Higuhre! ST F9F | GoAR (ETA| AR diferE aiifEe
WA ehaT TAFEE By 9419 q9El | oA e e
(154 AEETEE Bgafe FE aFaE T ATEEEE 659 BiPRE oA
&g 219y = A4l 94 TIre AR el vl whar Ffae st
wiide &fa eraaoETE/ Do age sab | gEwm one AGisT



19

&fHats sEER s oS4 T Sk T fawe g e
T G5AE (5158 TR TSl Al A¥E T7F T ARERE €54 iR
A 4+ (SII594 CFETE TrEd ATPHEE erET (SIHATH T2 AN
e #, 7 @0 CFIT UREIE 28 9OM fTeae ored) iqrw
A Tie iFeTe aeg Ff4a sl | «faF @S e 2 o9 wege
4T, (R e s faEre FReee wnE bareesan
q9%| T4 T | (FEE BIG TR CEGE @ YT [ TEF] 40|
wifere W% @R @GS [@nhE T aggEe Suy o o
w1F | (Ffffee sfiar weife aufs s afte fefew’ @=fte 3R
<4 FIH)

0 zo)l /gdt Wy [Rrme et [/fAftens
Foe YgJ O

AT IR S

¥ %] o el S sser N9 FUTE WEAAE Afre
3% A< Fraere afidle Arvee es@z i @i 9@w @eE Tel
TR HAC! AT FECE, (T HAC! [E Y A% | KRS (FEAIDIE
(SIFTE WF TEE FIHIA FW afzarn & 7 oAma wE § 6
#iaiE, 2 Feede aife Aot wifa afac (gheee Tad 99
TER) (i We FeE 9% @ES (9E s vl wEEte T B4
Si% qOE (AT | G e 9o W e 4F cofser sl e
@54 BIfP FAMS | SR (FEA 959 GEE (S0 239 749 UhE e
b e ferdm afw Fre e af sy 9fe as@ e cere oETe
fAfee Siva mraeRR v e o AT cEeE O FEE A6l Y T
(148



20

(3) (@FF 95 (AR F9E TEe el AFE TS @Ieie §fF
goard fagad Az Sfeg = |

(2) @m cagl| [ube IR, Fem ki, @m Smge
wioa FfEfE, ol [AEFIE @ T9eN Ik, F e IR 9=
tiifedt, @ Al oRaE =R{fEE, e T PR wiftfe, F1F
R wifem, Fife afeee Tot /abs =9 AfRme o & shfs
e & Fe ggl) wnve FRe e Framm vy Heg 6
S | SiEE U (o HEE SR

(o) ZE) /a1 Heade g fAve SR w3ered o9 (Post
mortem) 4% #iF S e FTWges @o6 (Inquest report)
51 T A @ A TiRETe | (78 [Fefle yerres o [Rew
[T Sife & SR @ TeEre g, ofie & e g, yerea & -
A JOiER Te-AT € & AR witg, w1 A Wy T oAwd
wiE, aifees »[ e & & waw (offm w9, <61 we), wemE Ba)
e (HEEE FeEs #0978 Febe oivae 9% FEE oY Wi
A 784 20F AAffate @GR! FEerea (euE SEe o% Y il
Al | FAEER oASreE Reibe Prue Wl = e @RIE TE @
T3 wesl S oFrEE 7rs @ Bl o1 39 @f @Rt e

(8) @ izt e g weed [oeed 2E R TR 5 e OF
GD Entry 72 9 UDeisR 4Agige 241 @3 srodm »42€t [
A (A6 TAR (HIE 4% (51699 TE4, 99 A (EFTE wage
ERR), TEes A9 efferave wifeg was | 92 g A9 e o
Joad ARIER/ AF 9T EAIE S0 SRE ©F | O Eee
(51159 SRS AT | |

(¢) yo= ¥ ga-bERUERAR §35 2E T R TG
afe Aeerg =& =St

férie gell/ WeIBeT Fere gl

w1 2l P @ e afere vt Far fave o SR



21

7T S @A YR WhE T @A F@EE @YADY Anre
TG R RIS | 9T WiEA IREe ¥oAE (LS 7Y AN T AT

(3) (F) @ Eies GhT T Toll FEE, Tfesw ahve =4
Gh1A e REe ordt APF-arT eI SR e o T
A 2l o1 S T Colf5aq e 2y w24 (FIR, Inquest
Report etc.) ez 37 19 759 Ag AETS (5169 ©F Fwa |

(<) Srebiee Fore foive g1 &' e wive e 7Re,
GEEAE 4@ 7w, A1 A oW @R ben R, or
DA o oF, *2e] Fuye w1 Bleere o o wfeq meg
ZfR (51157 €71 FAS | STEI5A FETE PI5E Tg) (241 WA e ewge
FW o7 W Gffes afes esegemm wige, (orm TWT AEETe
CEHTH F S F14 @ T GaFE ] AHE N GG Teaft Fiees
Fiaa 7sl | e T wivw' | fegres @< o[ =mst | 3 Fefifes
qifteee S Tramel 4, (org Af{EEe @ S 58 9haEE
TS G| (FIRI A | O CReEe BT dfewe erde
T2 &4 i | o e dfemm are fda @, o= A
HAlag 9 AS | O e ovTe (ore & (oive ArEme (e
=i =1 1o, R [Rawe wift 7w s |

(1) ferute goit 941 (wiea SAreiiee 49 dfemm aigE/ahe
(24l (sM6Ra ARTIE, inquest report, SEER oo T i
g Fieg #s |

LW e s Tanme swes gl 195 7 Trars
4% TREe (od iRy o GEn A ARD ol AR G
(w4 FfEE 2[00 (961 HEAT HEFE | aF SEEEE A9 ST
s FRE wMEee gReE  Fr [BeiR S T e eE



22

ANNEXURE - |

THE ASSAM DISTURBED AREAS ACT, 1955%
(Assam Act XIX of 1955)
(Passed by the Assembly)

{ Recerved the assent of the Governor of Assam on the 14th
December, 1955}

An Act to make better provision for the suppression of disorder
and for the restoration and maintenance of public order in disturbed
areas in Assam.

Preamble. Whereas it is necessary to make better provision for
the suppression of disorder and for the restoration and maintenance of
public order, in the disturbed areas in Assam.

It is hereby enacted in the Sixth Year of the Republic of India as
follows.

1. Short title, extent and commencement. (1) This Act may be
called the Assam Disturbed Areas Act, 1955,
(2) It extends to the whole of Assam subject to the provisions of
5.3 below.
(3) It shall come into force at once.

2. Definition. In this Act "disturbed area” means an area which
is for the time declared by notification under S.3 to be disturbed area.

3. Power to declare areas to be disturbed area. The State
Government may, by notification in the official Gazette, declare that
the whole or any part of any district of Assam as may be specified in
the notilication is a disturbed area.



23

4. Power to fire vpon person contravening orders. Any
Magistrate or Police Officer not below the rank of a Sub-Inspector or
Havildar in case of the Armed Branch of the Police or any olficer of
the Assam Rifles not below the rank of Havildar , may. if in his
opinion, it is necessary so Lo do for the maintenance of public order,
after giving such warning, if any, as he may consider necessary, lire
upon, or otherwise use force even to the causing of death, against any
person who is acting in force even to the causing of death, against any
person who is acting in contravention of any law or order for the time
being in force in a disturbed area, prohibiting the assembly of five or
more persons or the carrying of weapons or things capable of being
used as weapons or firearms, ammunition and explosive substances.

5. Power to destroy arms, fortified positions, etc. Any
Magistrale or Police officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector or
any officer of the Assam Rifles not below the rank of Jamadar may, if
in his opinion, it is necessary so to do destroy any arms, dump prepared,
or fortified positions or shelters from which armed attacks are made
or attempted, structures used gangs or absconders wanted for offences
in connection with the disturbances.

6. Protection of persons acting under Ss. 4 and 5. No suil.
prosecution or other legal proceeding shall be instituted except with
the previous sanction of the State Government against any person in
respect of anything done or purporting to be done in exercise of the
power conferred by Ss. 4 and 5.

7. Repeal of Ordinance V of 1955 (1) The Assam Disturbed
Areas Ordinance, 1955 (V of 1955), is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal any notification issued, anything
done or any action taken in exercise of the powers conlerred by or
under then said Ordinance shall be deemed to have done or taken in
the exercise of the powers conferred by or under this Act, asif this
Actwere in force on the day on which such notification was issued.
such thing was done or action was taken.

g a a



24

ANNEXURE - Il

THE ARMED FORCES (ASSAM AND MANIPUR)
SPECIAL POWERS ACT, 1958
(Act 28 of 1958)
(11th September, 1958)
An Act enable certain special powers .to be conferred upon
members of the armed forces in disturbed areas in the

State of Assam and the Union Territory of Manipur.

Be it enacted by Parliament in the ninth year of the Republic of
India as follows :

1. Short title and extent. (1) This Act may be called the Armed
Forces (Assam and Manipur) Special Powers Act, 1958,

(2) Definitions. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires-

(a) "armed forces" means the Military forces and the air forces
operating as land forces, and includes any other armed forces of the
Union so operating,

(b) "disturbed area” means an area which is for the time being
declared by Forces Act, 1950, or the Army Act, 1950 shall have the
meanings respectively assigned to them in those Acts.

3. Power to declare areas to be disturbed areas. If the
Governor of Assam or the Chief Commissioner of Manipur is of the
opinion that the whole or any part of the State of Assam or the Union
Territory of Manipur, as the case may be, is in such a disturbed or
dangerous condition that the use of armed forces in aid of the civil
power is necessary, he may, by Notification in the official Gazette,
declare the whole or any part of the State or Union Territory 1o be a
disturbed area.

4. Special powers of the armed foreces. Any commissioned
officer, warrant officer, noncommissioned officer or any other person
of equivalent rank in the armed forces may, in a disturbed area-

(a) If he is opinion that it is necessary so todo for the maintenance
of public order, after giving such due warning as he may consider
necessary, lire upon or otherwise use force, even to the causing of
death against any person who is acting in contravention of any law or




25

order forthe time being in forces in the disturbed area prohibiting the
assembly of five or more persons or the carrying on of weapon or of
things capable of being used as weapons or of firearms, ammunition
orexplosive substances:

(b) If he is of opinion that it is necessary so to do, destroy any
arms dump, prepared or fortified, position or shelter from which armed
attacks are made or are likely to be made or are attempted to be made,
orany structure used as a training camp for armed volunteers or utilized
as a hide-out by armed gangs or absconders wanted for any offence;

(¢) Arrest, without warrant, any person/who has committed a
cognizable offence/or against whom a reasonable suspicion exists that
he has committed/or is about to commit/a cognizable offence and may
use such force as may be necessary to effect the arrest;

(d) Enter and search without warrant, any premises to make
any such arrest as aforesaid or to recover any person believed to be
wrongfully restrained or confined or any property reasonably suspected
to be stolen property or any arms, ammunition or explosive substances
believed to be unlawfully kept in such premises and for that purpose
use such as may be necessary.

5. Arrested persons to be made over to the police. Any person
arrested and taken into custody under this Act shall be made over 1o
the officer-in-charge of the nearest police station with the least possible
delay, together with a report of the circumstance occasioning the arrest.

6. Protection to persons acting under this Act. No prosecution
suit or other legal proceeding shall be instituted, except with the
previous sanction of the Central Government, against person in respect
of anything done or purported to done in exercise of the powers
conferred by this Act.

7. Repeal and savings, (1) The Armed Forces (Assam and
Manipur) Special Powers Ordinance, 1958, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or
taken under this Act. as if Act had commenced on the 22nd day of
May, 1958, O O a



26
ANNEXURE - Ill

THE NATIONAL SECURITY ACT, 1950
(65 OF 1980)
[27th December, 1980]

An Act to provide for preventive detention in certain cases and
for matters connected therewith.

Be itenacted by Parliament in the thirty-first yearof the Republic
of India as follows :-

1. Short title and Extent- (/) This Act, may be called the
National Security Act, 1980,

(2) It extends to the whole of India except the State of Jammu
and Kashmir.

(2) Definitions- (/) In this Act, unless the context utherwise
requires,-

(a) "appropriate Government" means, as respects a detention
order made by the Central Government or a person detained under
such order, the Central Government and as respect a detention order
made by a state Government or by an officer subordinate to a State
Government or as respects a person detained under such order, the
State Government;

(b) "detention order" means an order made under Section 3;

(c) "foreigner" has the same meaning as the Foreigners Act,
1946 (31 of 1946);

(d) "person” includes a foreigner,

(e) "State Government", in relation to a Union territory, means
the administrator thereof,

3. Power to make orders detaining certain persons-

(1) The Central Government or the State Government may,-

(a) if satisfied with respect to any person that with a view Lo
preventing him from acting in any manner prejudicial o the defence
of India, the relations of India with foreign powers, or the security of
India, or



27

(b) if satisfied with respect o any foreigner that with a view to
regulating his continued presence in India or with a view to making
arrangements for his expulsion from India, it is necessary so to do,
make an order directing that such person be detained,

(2) The Central Government or the State Government may, if
satistied with respect to any person that with a view to preventing him
from acting in any manner prejudicial to the security of the State or
from acting in any manner prejudicial to the maintenance of supplies
and services essential to the community it is necessary so to do, make
an order directing that such person be detained.

Explanation-For the purposes of this Sub-section, " acting in
any manner prejudicial to the maintenance supplies and services
essential to the community "does not include" acting in any manner
prejudicial to the maintenance of supplies of commodities essential to
the community" as defined in the Explanation (o Sub-section 3 of the
Prevention of Black marketing and Maintenance of Supplies of
Essential Commodities Act, 1980 (7 of 1980), and accordingly, no
order of detention shall be made under this Act, on any ground on
which an order of detention may be made under that Act,

(3) If, having regard to the circumstances prevailing or likely to
prevail in any area within the local limits of the jurisdiction of a District
Magistrate or Commissioner of Police may also, if satistied as provided
in Sub-section (2), exercise the powers conferred by the said
Subsection:

Provided that the period specified in an order made by the State
Government under this Sub-section shall not, in the first instance,
exceed three months, but the State Government may, if satisfied as
aforesaid that it is necessary so to do, amend such order to extend
such period from time to time by any period not exceeding months at
any one time,

(4) When any order is made under this Section by an officer
mentioned in Sub-section (3), he shall forthwith report the fact to the
State Government to which he is subordinate together with the grouncs
on which the order has been made and such other particulars as, in his



28

opinion, have a bearing on the matter, and no such order shall remain
in force for more than twelve days after the making thereol unless, in
the meantime, it has been approved by the State Government:

Provided that where under Section 8 the grounds of detention
are communicated by the officer making the order after five days but
not later than ten days from the date of detention, this Sub-section
shall apply subject to the modification, that, for the words "twelve
days", the words "fifteen days" shall be substituted.

(5) When any order is made or approved by the State Government
under this Section, the State Government shall, within seven days,
report the fact to the central Government together with the grounds
on which the order has been made and such other particulars as, in the
opinion of the State Government, have a bearing on the necessity for
the order.

4. Execution of detention order-A detention order may be
executed at any place in India in the manner provided for the execution
of warrants of arrest under the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2
of 1974).

5. Power to regulate place and conditions of detention-Every
person in respect of whom a detention order has been made shall be
liable-

(a) to be detained in such place and under such conditions,
including conditions as to maintenance, discipline and punishment
for breaches of discipline, as the appropriate Government may, by
general or special order specify, and

(b) to be removed from one place of detention to another place
of detention, whether within the same State or in another State, by
order of the appropriate Government,

Provided that no order shall be made by a State Government
under clause (b) for the removal of a person from one State to another
State except with the consent of the Government of that other State.

6. Detention orders not to be invalid or in-operative on
certain grounds-No detention or order shall be invalid or in-operative
merely by reason-



29

(a) that the person to be detained thereunder is outside the limits
of the territorial jurisdiction of the Government or officer making the
order, or

(b) that the place of detention of such person is outside the said
limits.

7. Powers in relation to absconding person- (1) If the Central
Government or an officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Section 3,
as the case may be, has reason to believe that a person in respect of
whom a detention order has been made has absconded or is concealing
himself so that the order cannot be executed, that Government or
officer may-

(a) make a report in writing of the fact to a Metropolitan Magistrate
or a Judicial Magistrate of the First Class having jurisdiction in the
place where the said person ordinarily resides;

(b) by order notified in the Officer Gazette direct the said person
to appear before such officer, at such place and within such period as
may be specified in the order,

(2) Upon the making of a report against any person under clause
(a) of Sub-section (1), the provisions of Sections 82, 83, 84 and 85 of
the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974), shall apply in
respect of such person and his property as if the detention order made
against him were a warrant issued by the Magistrate,

(3) If any person fails to comply with an order issued under
clause (b) of Sub-section (1) he shall, unless he proves that it was not
possible for him to comply therewith and that he had, within the period
specified in the order, informed the officer mentioned in the order of
the reason which rendered compliance therewith impossible and of
his whereabouts, be punishable with imprisonment for term which
may extend to one year, or with fine, or with both.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974), every offence under Sub-section (3)
shall be cognizable.

8. Grounds of order of detention to be disclosed to persons
affected by the order- (/) When a person is detained in pursuance of



30

a detention order, the authority making the order shall, as soon as may
be, but ordinarily not later than five days and in exceptional
circumstances and for reasons to be recorded in writing, not later than
ten days from the date of detention, communicate to him the grounds
on which the order has been made and shall afford him the earliest
opportunity of making a representation against the order to the
appropriate Government.

(2) Nothing in  Sub-section (1) shall require the authority to
disclose fact which it considers to be against the public interest to
disclose.

9. Constitution of Advisory Boards- (/) The Central
Government and each State Government shall, whenever necessary,
constitute one or more Advisory Boards for the purposes of this Act,

(2) Every such Board shall consist of three persons who are, or
have been, or are qualified to be appointed, as Judges of a High
Court, and such persons shall be appointed by the appropriate
Government,

(3) The appropriate Government shall appoint one of the
members of the Advisory Board who is, or has been, a Judge of a
High Court to be its Chairman, and in the case of a Union territory
the appointment to the Advisory Board of any person who is a Judge
of the High Court of a State shall be with the previous approval of the
State Government concernzd. i

10. Reference to Advisory Board - Save as otherwise expressly
provided in this Act, in every case where a detention order has been
made under this Act, the appropriate Government shall, Within three
weeks from the date of detention of a person under the order, place
before the Advisory Board constituted by it under Section 9, the
grounds on which the order has been made and order, and in case
where the order has been made and the representation, if any made by
the person affected by the order, and in case where the order has been
made by an officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Section 3, alsothe
report by such officer under Sub-section (4) of that Section.

I'T. Procedure of Advisory Board- (/) The Advisory Board



31

shall, after considering the materials placed before it and, after calling
for such further information as it may deem necessary from the
appropriate Government or from any person called for the purpose
through the appropriate Government or from the person concerned,
and if, in any particular case, it considers it essential so to do if the
person concerned desires (o be heard, after hearing him in person,
submit its report to the appropriate Government within seven weeks
from the date of detention of the person concerned.

(2) The report of the Advisory Board shall specify in a separate
part thereof opinion of the Advisory Board as to whether or not there
15 sufficient cause for the detention of the person concerned.

(3) When there is a difference of opini®h among the members
forming the Advisory Board, the opinion of the majority of such
members shall be deemed to be the opinion of the Board.

(4) Nothing in this section shall entitle any person against whom
a detention order has been made to appear by any legal practitioner in
any matter connected with the reference to the Advisory Board; and
the proceedings of the Advisory Board and its report, excepting the
part of the report which the opinion of the Advisory Board is specified,
shall be confidential.

12. Action upon the report of the Advisery Board- (/) In
any case where the Advisory Board has reported that there is, in its
opinion, sufficient cause for the detention of a person, the appropriate
Government may confirm the detention order and continue the
detention of the person concerned for such period as it thinks fit.

(2) In any case where the Advisory Board has reported that
there is, in its opinion, no sufficient cause for the detention of a person,
the appropriate Government shall revoke the detention of a person,
the appropriate Government shall revoke the detention order and cause
the person concerned to be released forthwith.

13. Maximum period of detention- The maximum period
which any person may be detained in pursuance of any detention
order which has been confirmed under Section 12 shall be twelve
months from the date of detention:



32

Provided that nothing contained in this Section shall affect the
power of the appropriate Government to revoke or modily the detention
order at any earlier time.,

14. Revocation of detention orders- (/) Without prejudice to
the provisions of Section 21 of the General Clauses Act, 1897 (10 of
1897), a detention order may, at any time, be revoked or modified,-

(a) notwithstanding that the order has been made by an officer
mentioned in Sub-section (3) of Section 3, by the State Government
to which that officer is subordinate or by the Central Government;

(b) notwithstanding that the order has been made by a Stale
Government, by the Central Government.

(2) The revocation or expiry of a detention order under Section
3 against the same person in any case where [resh facts have arisen
after the date .,of revocation orexpiry on which the Central Government
or State Government or an officer mentioned in Sub-section (3) of
Section 3, as the case may be, is satisfied that such an order should be
made.

14 A. Circumstances in which person may be detained for
periods longer than three months without obtaining the opinion
of Advisory Boards- (/) Notwithstanding anything contained in the
foregoing provisions of this Act, or in any judgment, decree or order
of any court or other authority, any person in respect of whom an
order of any’court or other authority, any person in respect of whom
an order of detention has been made under this Act at any time before
the ’| 8th day of June, 1989] may be detained without obtaining the
opinion of the Advisory Board for a period longer than three months,
but not exceeding six months, from the date of his detention where
such person, had been detained with a view to preventing him, in any
disturbed area--

(i) from interfering with the efforts of Government in coping

with the terrorist and disruptive activities; and

(i) from acting in any manner prejudicial to-

(a) the defence of India; or

(h) the security of India; or



33

(¢) the security of the State; or

(d) the maintenance of public order, or

(¢) the maintenance of supplies and services essential to the

community,

Section 3, 8 and 10 to 14 shall have effect subject to the following
modifications, namely;

(a) in Sub-section (4), in the proviso,-

(A) for the words "ten days" the words "fifteen days” shall be
substituted;

(B) for the words "ten days”, the words " twenty days” shall be
substituted:

(ii) in Sub-section (5), for the words "seven days”, the words
"fifteen days" shall substituted;

(b) in Section 8, in Sub-section (1), for the words "ten days",
the words "fifteen days” shall be substituted;

(¢) in Section 10, for the words "shall, within three weeks”, the
words "shall, within four months and two weeks" shall be substituted;

(d)in Section 11,-

(i) in Sub-section (1), for the words "seven weeks", the words
"five months and three weeks" shall be substituted;

(i) in Sub-section (2), for the words "detention of the person
concerned", the words "continued detention of the person concemned”,
shall be substituted,

(e) in Section 12, for the words "for the detention”, at both the
places where they occur, the words "for the continued detention” shall
be substituted;

(f) in Section 13, for the words "twelve months", the words
"two years" shall be ;substituted:

(g)in Section 14, in the proviso to Sub-section (2), for the words
“twelve months” the words " two years" shall be substituted,

15. Temporary release of persons detained- (/) The
appropriate Government may, at any time, direct that any person
detained in pursuance of a detention order may be released for any
specified period either without conditions or upon such conditions



34

specified in the direction as that person accepts, and may, at any time,
cancel his release.

(2) In directing the release of any person under Sub-section (1),
the appropriate  Government may require him to enter into a bond
with or without sureties for the due observance of the conditions
specified .,in the direction.

(3) Any person released under Sub-section (1), shall surrender
himself at the time and , place, and to the authority, specified in the
order directing his release or cancelling his release, as the case may
be.

(4) If any person fails without sufficient cause, to surrender
himself in the manner specified in Sub-section (3), he shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
years, or with fine, or with both.

(5) If any person released under Sub-section (1) fails fulfil any
of the conditions imposed upon him under the said Sub-section orin
the bond entered into by him, the bond shall be declared to be forfeited
and any person bound thereby shall be liable 1o pay the penalty thereof.

16. Protection of a action taken in good faith- No suit or
legal proceeding shall lie against the Central Government or a State
Government, and no suit, prosecution or other legal proceeding shall
lie against any person, for anything in good faith done or intended to
be done in pursuance of this Act. |

17. Act not to have effect with respect to detentions under
State laws- (/) Nothing in this Act shall apply or have any effect with
respect to orders of detention, made under many State law, which are
in force immediately before the commencement of the National
Security Ordinance, 1980 (11 of 1980), and accordingly every person
in respect of whom an order of detention made under any State law is
in force immediately before such commencement, shall be Governed
with respect to such detention by the provisions of such State law
where the State law under which such order of detention is made is an
Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the State Ordinance) promulgated
by the Governor of the State and the State Ordinance has been



35

replaced-

(1ybefore such commencement, by an enactment passed by the
Legislature of the State, by such enactment; or

(i1) after such commencement, by an enactment which is passed
by the Legislature of the State and the application of which is confined
to orders of detention made before such commencement under the
State Urdinance, by such enactment,

as if this Act had not been enacted,

(2) Nothing in this section be deemed to bar the making under
Section 3, of a detention order against any person referred to in
Subsection (1) after the detention order in force in respect of him as
aforesaid immediately before the commencement of the National
Security Ordnance, 1980 (11 of 1980), ceases to have effect for any
reason whatsoever.

Explanation - For the purposes of this Section, " State law"
means any law providing for preventive detention on all or any of the
grounds on which an order of detention may be under Sub-section
(2) of Section 3 and in force in any State immediately before the
commencement of said Ordinance.

18. Repeal and saving- (/) The National Security Ordinance,
1980 (11 of 1980), is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
tzeken under the smd Ordinance shall be deemed to have been dene or
taken under he corresponding provisions of this Act, as if this Act had
come into force on the 23rd day of September, 1980, and in parnticular,
any reference made under Section 10 of the said Ordinance and pending

“before any Advisory Board immediately before the date on which
this Act receives the assent of the President may continue (0 be dealt
with by that Board after that date as if such Board had been constituted
under Section 9 of the Act.



36

ANNEXURE - IV
(Supreme Court’s instruction to the Armed forces Operating under AFSP

Do's

Act. 1958)
Para 54: List of Lo 's and Don'ts while Providing Aid to Civil Authorities

1. Actin closest possible communication with civil authorities throughout.
2. Maintain intercommunication if possible by telephone/radio.

3. Get the permission/requisition from the Magistrate when present.

4. Use the litte force and do as little injury to person and property as may

consistent with attainment of objective in view.

5. In case you decide to open fire-

(a) give waming in local language that fire will be effective,

(b) attract attention before firing by bugle or other means,

() distribute your in {ire units with specified commanders,

(d) control fire by issuing personal orders,

(e) note number of rounds fired,

(f) aim at the front of crowd actually rioting and inciting to riot or as

conspicuous ring-leaders, i.e. ., do not fire into the think of the crowd at the back.

forces.

(g} aim low and shoot for effect,

(h) keep Light Machine Gun and Medium gun in reserve.

(i) cease firing immediately once the object has been attained,

(j) take immediate steps Lo secure wounded.

f. Maintain cordial relations with Civilian authorities, and Para military

7. Ensure high standard of discipline.
Don't's
8. Do not use excessive force
9. Do not get involved in hand to hand struggle with the mob.
10. Do not ill treat anyone, in particular, woman and children.
11. No harassment of civilians.
12. No torture.
13. No communal bias while dealing with civilians.
14. No meddling in civilian administration affairs.
15. No military disgrace by loss/surrender of weapons.
16. No not accept presents, donations and rewards.
17. Avoid indiscriminate firing.



PR ————

T IFICHFT S A-SALHT FHIF (A P

| T AT e w63, W AeE, g e, SETed - | o 0% WS oA ifte
T G AT T AEAE, WA WEEE, WA, sy - - 7 g

- v B |




